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END USER LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR SNAPTURE 

 
IMPORTANT 
 
THIS IS A LEGAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN YOU (“YOU” AND “YOUR”) AND CII TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS, 
INC. (“CII”). CII IS WILLING TO  LICENSE THE CII SNAPTURE™ SOFTWARE (THE “SOFTWARE”) ONLY UPON 

THE CONDITION THAT YOU ACCEPT ALL OF THE TERMS CONTAINED IN THIS END USER LICENSE 
AGREEMENT ("AGREEMENT"). PLEASE READ THE TERMS CAREFULLY. YOU MUST CLICK “I AGREE” IN 

ORDER TO DOWNLOAD AND INSTALL THE SOFTWARE. IF YOU DO NOT AGREE TO THE TERMS OF THIS 
AGREEMENT, YOU WILL NOT BE ALLOWED TO DOWNLOAD AND INSTALL THE SOFTWARE.    
 
IF YOU ARE ACTING AS AN AGENT FOR A COMPANY, UNIVERSITY, SCHOOL OR OTHER ENTITY, YOU 
REPRESENT THAT YOU HAVE THE LEGAL AUTHORITY TO BIND SUCH COMPANY OR ENTITY AND SUCH 
COMPANY OR ENTITY WILL BE SUBJECT TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS AGREEMENT. 
 
1. Account Registration. In order to license and download the Software, you must register for an account 
(“Account”) by providing your email address, a password for your account, your first and last name, and any other 

information Cii may require from time to time. You are responsible for maintaining the confidentiality of your Account 
details and you are fully responsible for all activities that occur under your Account. Your Account must be used only 
by you and must not be shared with, or transferred to any other individual. You must immediately notify Cii at contact-
us@snaptureapp.com of any suspected or actual unauthorized or fraudulent use of your Account or any other breach 
of security. 
 
2. Privacy Policy. Cii takes your privacy very seriously. Any personal information you submit to us when setting up 

an Account shall be subject to our Privacy Policy located at https://snaptureapp.com/privacy-policy/ which is 
incorporated into this Agreement. You understand that through your opening an Account, you consent to the 
collection and use (to the extent stated in the Privacy Policy) of this information. 
 
3. Software License.   
 

(a) License Grant.   
 
 (i) Cii grants to you a nonexclusive, nontransferable license to install, copy, distribute, and use the executable 
version of the Software, and any accompanying documentation provided therewith ("Documentation") solely for your 

internal needs pursuant to the terms and conditions of this Agreement. Each license to install and use the Software is 
conditioned upon your compliance with the terms of this Agreement. Each Software license allows you to install and 
use the Software on a single Device. For the purposes of this Agreement, "Device" means a computer hardware 
system (whether physical or virtual) with a storage device or a mobile device capable of running the Software. A 
hardware partition or blade is considered to be a Device. Software licenses are floating licenses and are granted for 
one (1)-year terms. For each license, you may change the Device, but the Software may only be installed and used 
on one Device at any time. If you would like to install and use the Software concurrently on multiple Devices, then you 
will need to purchase multiple licenses. For example, if you would like to install and use the Software concurrently on 
ten (10) PCs, then you would need TO purchase ten (10) licenses. Subject to your compliance with the terms and 
conditions of this Agreement, an image of the Software may be placed onto an Internal network for the purpose of 
downloading and installing the Software onto a Device provided that the total number of Devices may not exceed the 
number of licenses purchased. 
    
 (iii) The Software may be activated (“Activation”) only with the use of a license key (the “License Key”), which 

is provided with the purchase of your license(s). Activation associates the use of the Software with one or more 
specific Devices. The License Key tracks and records the number of Devices on which the Software is installed. By 
way of illustration and example, if you purchase 5 licenses, the License Key will allow you to install and use the 
Software only on five Devices. During Activation, the Software will send information about the Software and the 
Device to Cii. None of this information contains personally identifiable information nor can it be used to identify any 
personal information about you. Cii will provide the License Key via the Internet and you will need to Activate the 
Software licenses through the Internet. If you renew your license(s), the License Key will be updated to extend your 
Software license(s) for one or more Renewal Terms (as defined below). 
 
 (iii)   Cii permits the creation of a reasonable number of backup copies of the Software provided such backup 
copies are not installed or used for other than archival purposes. 
 
(b)  Trial License.  A single Software license is provided free of charge for a seven (7) day trial period. The trial 
version will automatically cease operation after a period of seven (7) days from the date you downloaded the 
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Software and this Agreement will terminate after such period unless extended by Cii upon your acquisition of a full 
retail license. Trial licenses are granted pursuant to the terms and conditions of this Agreement, excluding any 
obligations to pay the applicable annual License Fee for use of the Software during the seven (7) day trial period.    
 
4. Restrictions.  The Software may be used only with Devices running the Microsoft Windows® operating system 

software. Your license to use the Software is limited to the use of the object code of the Software. You agree that you 
shall not directly or indirectly, either yourself or by assisting a third party, copy, modify, create a derivative work from, 
reverse engineer, reverse assemble or otherwise attempt to discover any source code, sell, rent, lease, loan, assign, 
sublicense, grant a security interest in or otherwise transfer any right in the Software, except as expressly permitted 
hereunder. You agree that Cii may audit your use of the Software for compliance with these terms at any time, upon 
reasonable notice. In the event that such audit reveals any use of the Software by you other than in full compliance 
with the terms of this Agreement, you shall reimburse Cii for all reasonable expenses related to such audit in addition 
to any other liabilities you may incur as a result of such non-compliance. Any distribution, transfer, or posting of the 
Software made in violation of the requirements, conditions, or restrictions of this section will be void and may result in 
termination of this Agreement and your licenses. 
 
Cii collects information for fraud and piracy prevention including the number of downloads or installations of the 
Software through a “call-home” system which may be sent to a Cii or a third party cloud server for storage or further 
processing by Cii or its vendors that provide license compliance services. Such information may include the IP 
address and Device and session ID. The Software includes technology designed to prevent unauthorized use and 
copying. Failure to follow the validation, installation, or license management process for the Software may result in 
such technology preventing the use of the Software. In addition, Cii utilizes monitoring and scouring technologies to 
obtain and transmit data on users of illegal copies of the Software. This data collection is not performed on valid and 
legal Software installations.  If you are using an illegal copy of the Software, you are subject to the collection and 
transmission of such data as described herein. You are advised to cease using the illegal version and contact Cii to 
obtain a legally licensed copy. 
 
5. Intellectual Property Ownership.  The license of the Software is not a sale. Title, ownership rights, and 

intellectual property rights in and to the Software and Documentation shall remain in Cii. You agree to abide by the 
copyright laws and all other applicable laws of the United States. Failure to comply with the above restrictions will 
result in automatic termination of this license and will make available to Cii other legal remedies. You may not 
disclose any of Cii’s proprietary or trade secret information relating to the Software to any third party. You agree to 
secure and protect the Software, Documentation and copies thereof in a manner consistent with the maintenance of 
Cii's rights therein and to take appropriate action by instruction or agreement with your employees or consultants who 
are permitted access to the Software to satisfy your obligations hereunder.  
 
6. License Fees. The annual license fee for the Software (the “License Fee”) is the amount then-quoted by Cii when 

you sign up for or renew your license for a one (1)-year term. Cii reserves the right to update the License Fee from 
time to time. When you sign up to purchase a license to the Software you will be directed to our third party payment 
processor (e.g., Stripe, etc.) for payment. All payments are due in advance and are nonrefundable. Approximately 
seven (7) days before the date that the Initial one (1)-year license term (the “Initial Term”) or each Renewal Term (as 

defined below) will expire, Cii will notify you of the pending expiration of the license and may provide you with the 
opportunity to extend the license for an additional one (1)-year period (a “Renewal Term”), subject to payment of the 

applicable License Fee. If you do not elect to renew your license and pay this annual License Fee, your license shall 
automatically terminate upon expiration of the Initial Term. You acknowledge that, if Cii changes the License Fee, this 
will not affect your existing licenses during the current annual period.  
 
7. Deleting Your Account. You can delete your Account and terminate your Software licenses at any time by 

locating the Customer Portal and accessing the ‘Delete Account’ option in your Account settings. Once you have 
deleted your Account, all Software licenses under your Account will be terminated and the Software will be 
deactivated. You will no longer have access to the Software. If you have an active Software license when you delete 
your Account, you will not receive a refund for any time remaining with respect to that license. 
 
8. Termination of Your Account by Cii. We reserve the right to modify, temporarily suspend or permanently delete 

your Account and terminate your Software license(s) if Cii has reason to believe that you have breached or acted 
inconsistently with the terms of this Agreement. Following termination, all Software licenses under your Account will 
be automatically revoked and Cii reserves the right to delete your Account and all of your Account information. If you 
have an active Software license when Cii deletes your Account, you will not receive a refund for any time remaining 
with respect to that license. 
 
9. No Representations or Warranties.  You understand and agree that the Software is provided “as is” and that 

your use of the Software is at your own risk. To the fullest extent permitted by applicable law, Cii MAKES NO 
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WARRANTIES, EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, WITH RESPECT TO THE SOFTWARE AND DOCUMENTATION AND 
SPECIFICALLY DISCLAIMS THE IMPLIED WARRANTIES OF MERCHANTABILITY, FITNESS FOR A 
PARTICULAR PURPOSE AND NONINFRINGEMENT. CII DOES NOT WARRANT THAT THE OPERATION OF THE 
SOFTWARE WILL BE UNINTERRUPTED OR ERROR FREE.  NO RIGHTS OR REMEDIES REFERRED TO IN 
ARTICLE 2A OF THE UCC WILL BE CONFERRED ON YOU UNLESS EXPRESSLY GRANTED HEREIN. THE 
SOFTWARE IS NOT DESIGNED, INTENDED OR LICENSED FOR USE IN HAZARDOUS ENVIRONMENTS 
REQUIRING FAIL-SAFE CONTROLS, INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION, THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, 
MAINTENANCE OR OPERATION OF NUCLEAR FACILITIES, AIRCRAFT NAVIGATION OR COMMUNICATION 
SYSTEMS, AIR TRAFFIC CONTROL, AND LIFE SUPPORT OR WEAPONS SYSTEMS. CII SPECIFICALLY 
DISCLAIMS ANY EXPRESS OR IMPLIED WARRANTY OF FITNESS FOR SUCH PURPOSES.  
 
NO ORAL OR WRITTEN INFORMATION OR ADVICE GIVEN BY CII, ITS DEALERS, DISTRIBUTORS, AGENTS 
OR EMPLOYEES SHALL CREATE A WARRANTY.  
 
SOME STATES DO NOT ALLOW THE EXCLUSION OF IMPLIED WARRANTIES, SO THE ABOVE EXCLUSION 
MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU. THIS WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS AND YOU MAY ALSO 
HAVE OTHER LEGAL RIGHTS THAT VARY FROM STATE TO STATE. 
 
10.  Limitation of Liability.   

 
(a) NEITHER CII NOR ITS SUPPLIERS SHALL BE LIABLE TO YOU OR ANY THIRD PARTY FOR ANY INDIRECT, 
SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, PUNITIVE, COVER OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES (INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED 
TO, DAMAGES FOR THE INABILITY TO USE YOUR COMPUTER HARDWARE OR ACCESS DATA, LOSS OF 
BUSINESS, LOSS OF PROFITS, BUSINESS INTERRUPTION OR THE LIKE), ARISING OUT OF THE USE OF, OR 
INABILITY TO USE, THE SOFTWARE AND BASED ON ANY THEORY OF LIABILITY INCLUDING BREACH OF 
CONTRACT, BREACH OF WARRANTY, TORT (INCLUDING NEGLIGENCE), SOFTWARE LIABILITY OR 
OTHERWISE, EVEN IF CII OR ITS REPRESENTATIVES HAVE BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH 
DAMAGES AND EVEN IF A REMEDY SET FORTH HEREIN IS FOUND TO HAVE FAILED OF ITS ESSENTIAL 
PURPOSE.  
 
(b) CII’S TOTAL AGGREGATE LIABILITY TO YOU FOR ACTUAL DAMAGES FOR ANY CAUSE WHATSOEVER 
AND FOR ALL CLAIMS AND DAMAGES WILL BE LIMITED TO THE MOST RECENT ANNUAL LICENSE FEE PAID 
BY YOU FOR THE SOFTWARE THAT CAUSED THE DAMAGES. THIS LIMIT IS AN AGGREGATE LIMIT THAT 
WILL NOT INCREASE ACCORDING TO THE NUMBER OF CLAIMS BROUGHT BY YOU.  
 
11. Indemnity. You agree to indemnify, defend, and hold Cii, its officers, employees, contractors, suppliers, affiliates, 

agents and licensors harmless from and against any losses, damages, cost, expense (including reasonable legal 
fees) or other liability, arising out of any claim, demand, allegation or proceeding brought by any third party due to, or 
arising out of your use of the Software or your breach of this Agreement. 
 
12.  Support Services. Cii does not offer or make available any real-time support services for the Software. If you 

have any problems or difficulties, please visit our Users Guide at: https://snaptureapp.com/user-guide/. 
 
13. Governing Law.  This Agreement is to be construed and governed in accordance with the internal laws of the 

State of North Carolina without reference to conflict of law principles. Any controversy or claim arising out of or relating 
to this Agreement, or the negotiation or breach thereof, shall be settled by arbitration in accordance with N.C. Gen. 
Stat. § 1-569.1 et seq. (the “Revised Uniform Arbitration Act”) and the then-current Rules of Commercial Arbitration of 
the  American Arbitration Association, and judgment upon the award rendered by the arbitrator may be entered in any 
court having jurisdiction thereof. The arbitration shall be held in Raleigh, North Carolina and shall be conducted in the 
English language, and shall be conducted before a single arbitrator mutually agreeable to the parties, or if no 
agreement can be reached, then selected by the American Arbitration Association. The arbitrator shall award 
reimbursement of attorneys' fees and other costs of arbitration to the prevailing party, in such manner as the arbitrator 
shall deem appropriate. In addition, the losing party shall reimburse the prevailing party for the costs and expenses 
incurred by it, including attorneys’, arbitrators’ and courts’ fees and expenses, in connection with any action or 
proceeding hereunder. If any court having proper jurisdiction hereof shall subsequently determine any portion of this 
Agreement to be invalid, such designation shall not affect the remaining provisions of this Agreement, which will 
continue in full force and effect. If, under applicable law, this arbitration provision is not enforceable as to a particular 
claim brought by one party against the other, then legal proceedings involving only that claim may be instituted solely 
either in the state court for the State of North Carolina, County of Wake, or in the United States District Court for the 
Eastern District of North Carolina located in Raleigh, North Carolina. For all purposes of this Agreement, all parties 
hereby irrevocably consent to the jurisdiction of such courts over their person and waive any defense based on 
improper or inconvenient venue or lack of personal jurisdiction. 
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14.  U.S. Government Restricted Rights. The Software and documentation are provided with RESTRICTED 

RIGHTS. Use, duplication, or disclosure by the government is subject to restrictions as set forth in subparagraph (c) 
(1) (ii) of the Rights in Technical Data and Computer Software clause at DFARS 252.227-7013 or Rights at 48 CFR 
52.227-19, as applicable. The Manufacturer is Cii Technology Solutions, Inc., 4700 Six Forks Road, Ste. 300, 
Raleigh, NC 27609.  As a condition to the license granted under this Agreement, you agree that the Software may not 
be downloaded or otherwise exported or re-exported: (i) into (or to the national resident of) any country to which the 
U.S. has embargoed goods; or (ii) to anyone on the U.S. Treasury Department's list of specially Designated Nationals 
or the U.S. Commerce Department's Table of Denial Orders. By using the Software, you agree to the foregoing and 
represents and warrants that neither you are not located in or under the control of, a national resident of any such 
country or on any such list. 
 
15. Miscellaneous.  This Agreement sets forth the entire agreement between you and Cii pertaining to the licensing 

of the Software, and supersedes in its entirety any and all written or oral agreements previously existing between the 
parties with respect to such subject matter. Failure to enforce any provision of this Agreement will not constitute a 
waiver. Any waiver must be in writing and signed by the waiving party If any provision of this Agreement is held 
invalid or unenforceable, such provision shall be revised to the extent necessary to cure the invalidity or 
unenforceability, and the remainder of this Agreement shall continue in full force and effect. In the event of any 
conflict between any provision of this Agreement and any applicable law, the provision or provisions of this 
Agreement affected shall be modified to remove such conflict and permit compliance with such law and as so 
modified this Agreement shall continue in full force and effect. This Agreement may not be assigned without the 
written consent of Cii. 
 
 


